RUPARELIA FOUNDATION

PAYMENT VOUCHER
PAYMENT NO RF/2024/09/1457 Date: 19-Sep-24
PAY M/S GT BANK (U) LIMITED RTGS IFO SADHGURU SCHOOL
AMOUNT USD 2,240/~ .
¥

(IN WORDS) USD Two Thousand Two Hundred Fourty Only
BEING Payment made to Sadhguru School for Contribution for Mellon Ahumuza The learning and

co-curricular education costs of One year from Aug 2024 to July 2025

[Inv. No: 2032

|Date 16/09/2024

Education costs 1 year 1 Children $ 2,240 )

Last Paid
13.09.2023 = $4,480/- for 2 Years 4 Child axn

\. \ /Q\.\t '\1

N,

\€ [?‘i_’t_ WA
PREPARED BY CHECKED BY

GRACE MURSHID

Chq NO fuueeeeeeee 1344  ChqDate : "‘“Q}W Chq Prepated\By : ........c..oooooooon,

ignaf,hrs R R e s mmmne




9/16/24, 11:43 AM Crane Management Services Ltd Mail - Re: Sadhguru Schaal

' M Gma il Dr. Sudhir Ruparelia <sudhir@rupareliagroup.com>
|

Re: Sadhguru School

1 message

Info Sadhguru School <info@sadhguruschool.org> Mon, Sep 16, 2024 at 11:25 AM
To: "Dr. Sudhir Ruparelia" <sudhir@rupareliagroup.com>
Cc: "Mrs. Jyotsna Ruparelia" <josh@rupareliagroup.com>

Dear Sudhir and Jyotsna,

Thank you for taking care of Mellon.

Attached is an invoice for her for $2,240 made out to Ruparelia Foundation.

With warmest wishes

Lulu

"Education needs inspiration, not just jsformation, only inspired human beings can transform their own lives and lives
around them" Sadhguru

Phone & WhatsApp: +256 772 466 333

https://www.sadhguruschool.org/

https://www.globalgiving.org/projects/adopt-a-childs-education-in-rural-uganda/

On Wed, Sep 11, 2024 at 12:55 PM Dr. Sudhir Ruparelia <sudhir@rupareliagroup.com> wrote:
Dear Lulu
Thank you for your email .
We would like for continuity and pay for the 1 child - Mellon so she can continue her
studies .

Regards
Dr. Sudhir Ruparelia

On Tue, Sep 10, 2024 at 11:16 AM Info Sadhguru School <info@sadhguruschool.org> wrote:
Dear Sudhir and Jyotsna,

| hope you are both well and the family too. | wonder if you were able to dip into our 2023 annual report sent
earlier in the year - appreciating it was rather long for busy days, but hopefully you were able to glimpse at it and
get an impression of how things are trying to move forward.

It was in September last year that you donated $4,480 towards two children and we are wondering if Ruparelia
Foundation would like to maintain this relationship for consequent years? It is a shame that Godlive moved away
and left school, but unfortunately despite closely interviewing parents, and considering their home environment,
completing memorandums of understanding, it's a reality we have to deal with from time to time which is outside
our control. I'm still coming to terms with it, but each year out of 100+ children we lose two or three to irresolvable
family events, At present we have 115 children in school from Reception to Year 8 (Year 7 is the start of our lower
secondary). At end August we began our new academic year.

With warmest wishes

Lulu

hitps://mail.google.cam/mail/uf0/?ik=773b37 4ed9&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1727083872687565063%7Cmsg-f:1810340428204556...  1/9



a

SCHOOL

INVOICE TO: INVOICE NO 2052
Ruparelia Foundation, PO Box 3673, Kampala DATE: 16/9/2023
Ttem | Description Unit Price Per Total
Child
In warm appreciation we are requesting your contribution
for Mellon Ahumuza:
The learning & co-curricular education costs of one Year 2
child from August 2024 to July 2025 $2,240 $2,240
Sub-total $2,240
Taxes
TOTAL (USD) $2,240 |
With gratitude we request your payment be made to our Stanbic A/C
Bank STANBIC BANK UGANDA
Branch FORT PORTAL
Account Name SADHGURU SCHOOL
Account number (dollar) 9030012863844
SWIFT SBICUGKX
Address PLOT 21, LUGARD RD, P.0. BOX 107, FORT PORTAL, UGANDA

Ndali, Kasenda, Fort Porial, Kabarale, Tooro. Uganda Tel +256 788 506 121
info@sadghuruschool.org = www.sadghuruschool.org
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Mame: i gl?ﬁﬂiﬂ-l& fouwDation

Address: CR)WIE CHAMBRAS

Email address:

Currency: [ZJUGX [ 4TUSD [ GBe [ ur (] OTHERS (Specify)

Amount (in figures):_el, *H0
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Beneficiary's Address: __ IPkOT 21 Luaaeh RIS, Po Box 10%, forg f3

Beneficiary's A/C No.: Q0300128633 14

“Nith Bank (Name & Address); %‘ﬁwm
i PoR Ty

In favour of:

e —

Purpose:

Source of wealth & source of funds:

Nature of sender’s business:

Nature of beneficiary’s business:

Relationship between (e sender & beneficiary:
S ——

Should we expect similar transactions in the future: (] Yes [ INo

Confirm that this IS NOT a third party transaction:

[ Yes [ INo

~ Ml correspondent bank &harges to be
[ Applicant (] Shared

 Seléct Payment Wiethod For Thi

bourne by

] Dedit Account No, BT 161 ] @@Iﬂl{]

Cheque Details:
Cheque No.: IB'-H,

Signature of Applicant:

Amount:

In case of a telegraphic eritis understood, the same is sant a
that the bank is ot held liable either for any technical Mistake, delay or OMmission |
which may occur in the transmission of misinterpretation when received. '

| undertake to pay the charges for retransmission if this oceyrs. I unclerstand that
there may be further charges to benef‘iciary. '
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¢ 9/26/24,'3:41 PM uniss.bou.or.ug/web/rtgsDetailRepart.do?data=@@0023SNSGTBIP24 263A000840011MRTERS520009RUN270009POI27 @@

CONFIDENTIAL
Bank of Uganda Produced : 26.09.2024 15:41:12
RTGS System Environment : P

FS002 - Funds settlement instruction detail

Selection criteria:

Participant = Guaranty Trust Bank Uganda Limited
Originator = Guaranty Trust Bank Uganda Limited
System instruction reference code = GTBIP24263A00084

Funds settlement value date: 19.09.2024 - Final

Header
MRT(Message routing cade) FFP1 (Standard FC FSI (Single, with PI, RTM))
APP(Message application code) WEB
APE(Application environment) P
APV(Application version) 632
ODT(Originator date) 19.09.2024
OCD(Originator BIC network code) |GTBIUGKA (GTBANK)
gokdlg)()riginator instruction reference GTBI24263SA00128
SND(Sender BIC network code) UGBAUGKATIA (WEBSERVER)
ADC(Addressee BIC network code) |SBICUGKX (STANBIC)
RRC(Recipient BIC network code) SBICUGKX (STANBIC)
LSR(Finalised by) 27RN1459
fsgé)Svstem instruction reference GTBIP24263A00084

Content
Eﬁ'igf,g:ig‘)‘e end-to-end transaction | ) .9497-efc4-4a37-aad4-defd82e64287
BOC(Bank operation code) CRED

EFS(Expected funds settlement

value date) 19.09.2024

CUR(Currency code) USD (US Daollar)

STA(Funds settlement amount) 2,240

PCA(Paying customer account

number) 218/131164/2/5111/0
OCN(Paying customer name and

address) THE RUPARELIA FOUNDATION
I0B(Initial ordering institution) GTBIUGKA (GTBANK)
BCA(Beneficiary customer account

number) 9030012863844
BCN(Beneficiary customer name and

address) SADHGURU SCHOOL
PID(Payment instruction detail) CONTRIBUTION
CHR(Charges detail) SHA (Charges shared by paying and beneficiary customer)
REC(Receiver information code) CUSTM (Custr)

RRF(Related reference code) LOP190924RUP
BKB(Beneficiary bank BIC code) SBICUGKX (STANBIC)
BKP(Paying bank BIC code) GTBIUGKA (GTBANK)

SWT(Back-office SWIFT message) {1:FO1UGBAUGKBAXXX8040279898}
{2:00961308240919EANFXXXXEXXX073803686124091916085}{3:{103:UIS}
{108:UGBAUGKAA1608359}3{4:{1:FO1UGBAUGKAATIA3405675359}{2:1103SBICUGKXXXXXN}{3:
{103:UIS}{113:WEB }{121:c11e9497-efc4-4a37-aad4-defdB82e64287}}{4:
:20:GTBI242635A00128

:23B:CRED

:32A:240919USD2240,

:50K:/218/131161/2/5111/0

THE RUPARELIA FOUNDATION

:52A:GTBIUGKA

:59:/9030012863844

SADHGURU SCHOOL

:70:CONTRIBUTION

171A:SHA

https://uniss.bou.or.ug/web/rigsDetailReport.do?data=@@0023SNSGTBIP24263A000840011MRTERS20009RUN270009P0O127 @@ 112
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172:/REC/CUSTM/OCD/GTBIUGKA/RRF/LOP1909

JJ24RUP/APV/632/MRT/FFP1/BKB/SBICUG

[{KX/ODT/20240919/BKP/GTBIUGKA/LSR/

//27RN1459/APE/P
-H5:{CHK:34E56F59BBC1}{MRF:240919130808240919UGBAUGKAAXXX3405675359} } }{5:
{PAC:00000000}{CHK:9773F9941116}{5YS:1308240919UGBAUGKAATIA3405675359} H{S:{FAC:}
{COP:P}{SIG: <SignatureList> <SwSec:Sighature:> <SwSec:SignedInfo> <Sw:Reference>
<Sw:DigestValue>ggw6lLbBa/UCuTA/G8sCBglaUyms-+XzGnvRBbCazGgIM= < /Sw:DigestValue>
</Sw:Reference> </SwSec:SignedInfo> <SwSec: SignatureValue>PEMF@Proc-Type: 4,MIC-ONLY
Content-Domain: RFC822

EntrustFile-Version: 2.0

Originator-DN: cn=richard-mayebo,o=ugbaugka,o=swift

Orig-SN: 1707631342

MIC-Info: SHA256, RSA,

NPOrRbijMI9gvIFzEoxKWY3rou9z 1zyyzSDXDacHIsSMqPthZo8DI8eApAPenHkHM
avMz91EGn1ek2gd4tjSOCNQ7ZtOnZfQ5Vyg2GIRDztWXh51PmS/FUeRkY1ULTtBo
EIr6Q4yEEQOYTITHUVMmcS5aCn7Ph1uTmG/zubulUEQSIINIZfzK2RsTg7gw050M5n
KD9hxwIP8L5r3GRtUzu4g7QAZdsQli6 DFCplUSiMwCSqrsBR1h2ABKkKVfgfhves
rr07a12dHI1VofuGTmbWY9IKGcP2SPIpy2mkhyDgZLm7Jz/aM0gBHgTMILLMHZ 3g
U3GxvgnxrUHcosFMd56+rQ==

</SwSec:SignatureValue><SwSec:KeyInfo> <SwSec:SignDN>cn=richard-
mayeho,o=ughaugka,o=swift</SwSec:SignDN>

<SwSec:CertPolicyld>1.3.21,6.2 </SwSec: CertPolicyld > </SwSec:KeyInfo> < SwSec: Manifest>
<Sw:Reference> <Sw:DigestRef>M</Sw:DigestRef>
<Sw:DigestValue>NZyPmBQg/22+-csHzjpEFSnzWXWdcBV84zMXH25pQIQQ=</Sw:DigestValue>
</Sw:Reference> <Sw:Reference><5w:DigestRef>1</Sw:DigestRef>
<Sw:DigestValue>W9IUI8+RS+T0S5222WXoLO1ihYDj+CWT 1fK3Ap8KjR7D0=</Sw:DigestValue>
</Sw:Reference> <Sw:Reference><Sw:DigestRef>Sw.E25</Sw:DigestRef>
<Sw:DigestValue>0vxP/KbPUwbZ 7KcUrQpgReYCAcWxnXEulmAZhzKIK1w=</Sw:DigestValue >
</Sw:Reference> < /SwSec:Manifest> </SwSec:Signature> < /SignatureList>}
{INS:ACCESS/RTGSOUT}{UNT:None}{USR:all_adm?}}

uniss.bou.or,ug/web/rtgsDetailReport.do?data=@@0023SNSGTBIP24263A000840011MRTER520009RUN270009P0127 @@

MTT(MT type) 103
YRS(Y-copy response indicator) iz
SIC(Service identifier code) uI1s

Interpreted tags : Generic defined

ETG(Interpreted tag)

|ADC (Addressee BIC network code)

Life cycle

status

Current processing

Date and time

Registered

19.09.2024 16:08:15

Settled

19.09.2024 16:08:15

Resulting messages sent by the central funds settlement system:

Dispatch Originator
date and instruction Message |Dispatched | Acknowledgement | Acknowledgement
Recipient|Addressee| time reference code type indicator required date and time |Acknowledger
$uaragty k |19.09.2 ?&Zﬁﬁic
rust Ban .09.2024 i
Webserver Uganda 16:08:15 2426316081598000 ﬁ;g Yes No
Limited (Debit))
COoP2
SWIFT SWIFT 19.09.2024 (Funds
FIN-Copy |FIN-Copy |16:08:15 |24263160815995001 0iiamen [YeS o
reply)
T Bk | o 9024 (Nssigg'e P
Webserver e 2426316081600000 |FSI settled |Yes No
Uganda 16:08:16 tificati
Limited notification
(RTM))

- END OF REPORT -

https:funiss.bou.or.ug/web/rtgsDetallReport.do?data=@@0023SNSGTBIP24263A000840011MRTER520009RUNZ270009PO127 @@
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9/26/24, 1211 PM Crane Management Services Lid Mail - Re: Sadhguru School

M Gmail Dr. Sudhir Ruparelia <sudhir@rupareliagroup.com>

.Re: Sadhguru School

1 message

To: "Dr. Sudhir Ruparelia" <sudhir@rupareliagroup.com>
Cc: "Mrs. Jyotsna Ruparelia" <josh@rupareliagroup.com>

Dear Sudhir and Jyotsna,

Thank you for the very prompt action, funds gratefully received.

S |

SCHOOL

‘Education needs inspiration
not just information. Only
inspired human beings can
transform their own lives &
lives around them.’

- Sadhguru

The Ruparelia Foundation

Meeting the majority education costs
of 1 student at Sadhguru School at
$2,240/child/pa

Receipt 19th September 2024

Received $2,240
on behalf of student Mellan Ahumuza

with all our love and gratitude

on behalf of Sadhguru School students
and for your encouragement on our paths
of self discovery and unenfoldment

chool.org

o sadhguru schools o sadhguruschool sadhguru_schools
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Info Sadhguru School <info@sadhguruschool.org> Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 12:00 PM
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